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CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT BID NAME: IFB#20-0522 SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE UNIFORMS
SCHOOL NUTRITION PROGRAM BID DUE DATE: 5.22.9020
. IFB#20-0522 RESPONSES
VENDOR A VENDOR B VENDOR C VENDOR D VENDOR E VENDOR F VENDOR G VENDOR H
VENDOR THEH%"SEE i gsggﬁgg & ORCIJE;‘:?_I i CAMPUS WEAR UNIFORM SOURCE | T EESELF?SES THUNDER ROAD, INC| BSN SPORTS,LLC
INDIANAPOLIS, IN ATHENS,GA LAWRENCVILLE, GA | ALPHARETTA, GA KENNESAW, GA JONESBORO, GA | LAWRENCEVILLE, GA DALLAS, TX
MEN'S POLO STYLE [315.05 (S-XL) $13.80 (XS-XL) $20.08 (S-XL) $15.00 (SM-XL) s12.75 (xs-xv) $12.50 (XS-XL) $12.00 $15.90 (S-XL)
SHIRT $17.75 (2X) $14.80 (2XL) $22.16 (2X-3X) $16.00 (2XL) $13.75 (2XL) $14.50 (2XL-3XL) $17.35 (2X)
$20.39 (3X) $17.25 (3XL-4XL) $27.38 (4XL) I318.00 (3xL) $15.75 (3XL) $17.50 (4XL) _s11.00 $20.25 (3X)
$ 21,75 (4X) $19.00 (4XL) $16.75 (4XL) Priced Hanes 055P $ 21.70 (4X)
WOMEN'S POLO [s15.95 (S-XL) $13.80 (XS-XL) $20.08 (S-XL) $15.00 (SM-XL) $12.75(XS-XL) $12.50 (XS-XL) $12.00 $15.90 (S-XL)
STYLESHIRT  ls1775 (2x) $14.80 (2XL) $22.16,(2X-3X) $16.00 (2XL) §13.75 (2XL) $14.50 (2XL-3XL) $17.35 (2X)
3$20.39 (3X) $17.25 (3XL-4XL) $27.38 (4XL) $18.00 (3XL) $15.75 (3XL) $17.50 (4XL) $11.00 $20.25 (3X)
$21.75 (4X) $19.00 (4XL) $16.75 (4XL) Priced Hanes 055P $ 21.70 (4X)
MEN'S WORK  [s17.00 $21.00 $19.00 (28-42) $32.00 (28-48) NO BID $22.60 (28-40) 322.75 NO BID
PANTS Priced Edwards 2577 $ 21.00 (44-54) $34.00 (50) $32.00 (42-50)
Priced Cintas-945 Priced Red Kap PT10
WOMEN'S WORK [s17.00 $17.75 $19.00 $32.00 NO BID $ 22.60 (4-12) 322.75 NO BID
PANTS Priced Edwards 8567 Priced Cintas 390 & 395 |Priced FP321 $32.00 (14 up) P
‘ $30.00 Priced Red Kap P233KH
Priced FP774
WOMEN'S SHCES |[s85.00 $53.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $52.50 372.00 NO BID
(76580 or equal) Priced Reebok RB110
1359.50 $54.00
E‘;i;:d Weinbrenner 834- Priced 77200
WOMEN'S SHOES |s85.00 $44.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.50 3$59.00 NO BID
(76536 or equal) $49.00

Priced Skechers 200000

Priced Weinbrenner 834-..
6520

Priced as 76584
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CCSD WITNESS

This institution is an equal opportunity provider.
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CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT BID NAME: IFB # 20-0522 SCHOOL FOOD SERVICE UNIFORMS
SCHOOL NUTRITION PROGRAM (SNP) BID DUE DATE: 5.22.2020
IFB#20-0522 TABULATION .
VENDOR A VENDOR B VENDOR F VENDOR G
VENDOR THE UNIFORM SSLZF: TOTAL BID UNIFORMS SS\P’JZF: TOTAL BID T &T UNIFORMS S;T;: TOTAL BID THUNDER ROAD, SST\E? TOTAL BID
HOUSE ORDER PRICING UNLIMITED orper | PRICING SOUTH, INC ORDER PRICING INC orpe | PRICING
INDIANAPOLIS, IN ATHENS,GA JONESBORO, GA LAWRENCEVILLE, GA
MEN'S POLO STYLE |$15.95 (S-XL) 100 |$1,585.00 $13.80 (XS-XL) 100 |$ 1,380.00 |$12.50 (X5-XL) 100 $  1,250.00 |$12.00 100 |[$ 1,200.00
SHIRT $17.75 (2X) 514.80 (2XL) $14.50 (2XL-3XL)
$20.39 (3X) $17.25 (3XL-4XL) $17.50 (4XL) $11.00
$21.75 (4%) gg:;nale. Priced Hanes
WOMEN'S POLO  |515.95 (S-XL) 375 |$5,981.25 $13.5_0 (X8-XL) 375 $ 5175.00 |$12.50 (XS-XL) 375 $  4687.50 [$12.00 405 |$ 4,860.00
STYLESHRT  ls1775 (2x) 30 |s532.50 $14.80 (2XL) 30 |$  444.00 [$14.50 (2XL-3XL) - 30 |s  435.00
$20.39 (3X) $17.25 (3XL-4XL) $17.50 (4XL) $11.00
521,75 (4%) g\g:;nale. Priced Hanes
MEN'S WORK PANTS|s17.00 40  |$680.00 $21.00 40 $  840.00 |$22.60 (28-40) 40 $ 904,00 [$22.75 40 | § 910.00
Priced Edwards 2577 i $32.00 (42-50)
Priced Red Kap PT10
WOMEN'S WORK  [$17.00 300 |$5,100.00 $17.75 300 $ 5,325.00 |$22.80 (4-12) 300 $ 5,780.00 |822.75 300 |$ 6,825.00
PANTS Priced Edwards 8567 ) $32.00 (14 up)
Priced Red Kap P233KH
WOMEN'S SHOES |$65.00 70 |54,550.00 $53.00 70 $ 3,710.00 |$52.50 70 $ 3,675.00 |$72.00 70 $ 5,040.00
(76550 or equal) Priced Reebok RB110
$69.50 $54.00 **
Priced Weinbrenner 834- Alternate Priced 77200-
5522 Not Equal
WOMEN'S SHOES |$65.00 35 $2,275.00, $44.00 35 $ 1,540.00 |$69.50 35 $ 2,432.50 {$59.00 . 35 § 2,085.00
(765386 or equal) $49.00
Priced Weinbrenner 834- Allernate: Priced as
Priced Skechers 200000 5520 76584
VENDOR VENDOR TOTALS
Vendor A |The Uniform House $20,713.75 I
Vendor B |Uniforms Unlimited §18,414.00 |
Vendor F |T&T Uniforms South $20,164.00 | '
Vendor G |Thunder Road $20,900.00 |
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CCSD WITNESS

This institution is an equal opportunity provider.




